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Minutes of the 14th meeting of the Association Executive Committee

Reims, France: 15-17 November, 2009

Present: Christine Roland-Levy [President & Chair], Julie Spinthourakis [President-Elect], Alistair Ross [Past-President], Anne-Marie Van den dries [Treasurer], Susana Goncalves [Secretary], Marta Fulop, Riitta Korhonen, Nanny Hartsmar, Beata Krzywosz-Rynkiewicz,

Peter Cunningham [by invitation], Lindsay Melling [minutes]

14.1
Apologies

Christine Roland-Levy, Susana Goncalves and Marta Fulop for parts of the meeting.

14.2
Chair’s Announcements

CRL attended the CitizED meeting in Hong Kong and reported a good atmosphere with open discussions. CitizED are happy to advertise the CiCe conference and in return we have agreed to advertise the CitizED conference. 

14.3
Minutes of the 13th CiCea meeting in Coimbra and matters arising

The minutes of the thirteenth meeting of the Association Executive were accepted as a true record of the meeting held in Coimbra in June 2009.

Matters arising

13.3 The image for the journal has only just been agreed by the editorial board so this will be available to CiCea in due course. 

13.11 CRL put forward the proposal for Bjorn Sundmark to become a member of the Citizenship Teaching and Learning editorial board. However, there were other good candidates and the board did not select him to become the European Chief Editor. He will be asked to be involved in the journal from time to time. NH will contact him to inform him of the decision.  

14.4 Election timetable / arrangements

President Elect: 1 Oct 2010 – 30 Sept 2012, President: 1 Oct 2012 – 30 Sept 2014, Past-President: 1 Oct 2014 – 30 Sept 2016

	Nominations open
	1 March 2010

	Nominations close
	26 March 2010

	Voting opens
	12 April 2010

	Voting closes
	10 May 2010

	Announcement of successful candidate
	Barcelona Conference, 20-22 May 2010


JS, in conjunction with CRL, will take responsibility for the election process and will liaise with LM to ensure the timetable is adhered to, the announcement and call for nominations is sent out and the election process is efficiently managed. 

Nominations

The nominations are to consist of a statement from the candidate (one page of A4 maximum) plus the names of two proposers. The candidate must be a fully paid-up CiCea member (individual or institutional) by 1 March 2010. The proposers must both come from different countries and must both be fully paid-up CiCea members (individual or institutional) by 1 March 2010. 

Voting

All fully paid-up CiCea members at 26 March 2010 will be eligible to vote in the election. Individual members will have one vote and institutional members ten votes. The institutional contact for each institutional member will be advised to consult their colleagues at their institution before casting their ten votes.

Administration

LM will use online survey software called Survey Monkey to set up the electronic nomination and voting process (www.surveymonkey.com). We will need to ensure that members can only vote once and will not be able to log into the system a second time after submitting their vote. 

14.5
Membership

Individual and institutional membership lists at 13 November 2009 were circulated. There are currently 49 individual members and 19 institutional members; the majority of these are renewals with a small number being new members. It was agreed that one of the roles of the Past-President will be to follow-up previous members to encourage them to re-new their membership. 
14.6
Finances

AMVdd circulated the draft treasurer’s report for 1 October 2008 to 30 September 2009 and outlined the financial situation. The income and expenditure for 2008/09 was very similar to that for 2007/08. 

The EC discussed ways in which the financial management of CiCea may be organised and who should have responsibility for writing and submitting the various reports that are required. It was suggested that it would be useful to have a calendar showing the various activities/tasks throughout the year and who is responsible for them. Discussion of this item will continue by email and will be confirmed at the meeting in Athens.

14.7
Research grant

One application for the research grant has been received. MF proposes that the application be approved and will circulate the proposal to the rest of the EC for consideration.

We have not received a report from the group who received the first research grant. MF and JS will follow this up with Maria Pagoni.

14.8
Research Centre Network

A hard copy of the research centre network booklet was distributed to all members with their invoices in October 2009. 

14.9
Newsletter

The next issue of the newsletter will be distributed in mid-December and the deadline for contributions to be sent to SG is 30 November. The topic for the issue will be ‘sustainability’.

14.10
Transition in 2009/10

Discussion on this item will be started by email and will be concluded at the EC meeting in Athens in February 2010.

14.11
Website

Item postponed until EC meeting in February 2010. 

14.12 Journal

BKR is book reviews editor for the special issue co-edited by CRL and JS, and has sent out letters to invite members to submit a book review for the special issue. To date seven responses worthy of consideration have been received. Some of these are reviews of English-language books and others are in the reviewer’s first language. The deadline for the reviews is 31 December 2009 and the submitted reviews will be presented to the EC by BKR in Athens.

JS and CRL have prepared a letter and notes to contributors and have started to send these to the proposed list of authors. The authors have been asked to respond to the invitation by 1 December 2009. The abstracts are required by March 2010 and the full papers by 30 April 2010. The special issue needs to be ready for print in November 2010 and will go to press in January 2011 (with a June 2011 date).

14.13 Any other business

There was no other business.

Actions arising from this meeting

	Minute point
	Action
	By Whom
	When

	14.3
	Inform Bjorn Sundmark re decision of CitizED board
	NH
	Nov

	14.4
	Prepare presidential election announcement to go in Nov newsletter
	JS/CRL
	30 Nov

	14.4
	Prepare election nomination papers 
	JS/CRL
	31 Jan

	14.4
	Draft election form in Surveymonkey
	LM
	31 Jan

	14.6
	Draft annual report to be circulated to EC
	CRL
	Nov

	14.6
	Final version of annual report to be signed and posted to London Metropolitan University
	CRL
	Nov

	14.7
	Research grant application to be circulated to EC
	MF
	Nov

	14.7
	EC to make decision re research grant
	All
	Nov

	14.7
	Request report from previous research grant recipients
	MF/JS
	Nov

	14.9
	Contributions for newsletter to SG
	All
	30 Nov
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